318 New Mexico Register / Volume XXVI, Issue 7 / April 16, 2015

HOUSEHOLD 100% 133% 138% 190% 240% 250% 300%
SIZE
[$1:294] [$1343] [$1:848] [$2;334] [$2:432]
! (597318981 | g, 305 $1,354 $1.864 $2.354 2453 | [52918]182.943
[$131H] [$1:744] [$1:809] [$2:491] [$3:146] [$3:278]
2 $1.328 $1,766 $1.832 $2,523 $3.186 $3319 |[53933183.989
[$+650] [$2:194] [$2:276] [$3:134] [$3:959] [$4123]
3 $1.675 $2.227 $2.311 $3.181 $4.019 4186 |[5H548185.023
[$1+988] [$2;644] [$2;743] [$3:777] [$4:770] [$4:969]
4 $2.021 $2,688 $2.789 $3.840 $4.850 §5.053 |[55963186.063
[$25326] [$3;694] [$3:216] [$4420] [$5,582] [$5:815]
> $2.368 $3.149 $3.268 $4.499 $5.682 gs.019 | [56978187.103
[$2:665]. [$3:544] [$3:677] [$5:662] [$6;395] [$6;661]
6 $2.715 $3.610 $3.746 $5.157 $6.515 s6786 | [57993188.143
[$3,063] [$3;994] [$4144] [$5:705] [$7:206] [$7,567]
7 $3.061 $4,071 $4.224 $5.816 $7.346 §7653 | [59-008]89.183
3 [$3:341] [$4444] [$46H] [$6;348] [$8;618] [$8,353] [616,623]
$3.408 $4,532 $4.703 $6.475 $8.178 $8.519 $10.223
+1 [$338] 8347 | [$4560] $461 | [$467] $479 | [$643] $659 | [$812] $832 | [$846] $866 | [$1:615] $1,040

[8.291.430.10 NMAC - Rp, 8.291.430.10 NMAC, 1-1-14; A, 5-1-14; A/E, 4-1-15]

REGULATION AND LICENSING DEPARTMENT
CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRIES DIVISION

14.8.2 NMAC, 2009 New Mexico Plumbing Code, (filed 5-29-13) repealed and replaced by 14.8.2 NMAC, 2012 New Mexico Plumbing
Code, effective 05/01/2015.

14.8.3 NMAC, 2009 New Mexico Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, (filed 5-29-13) repealed and replaced by 14.8.3 NMAC, 2012
New Mexico Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, effective 05/01/2015.

14.9.2 NMAC, 2009 New Mexico Mechanical Code, (filed 5-29-13) repealed and replaced by 14.9.2 NMAC, 2012 New Mexico
Mechanical Code, effective 05/01/2015.

14.9.6 NMAC, 2009 New Mexico Solar Energy Code, (filed 09-27-2011) repealed and replaced by 14.9.6 NMAC, 2012 New Mexico Solar
Energy Code, effective 05/01/2015.

REGULATION AND LICENSING DEPARTMENT
CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRIES DIVISION

TITLE 14 HOUSING AND CONSTRUCTION

CHAPTER 8 PLUMBING CODES

PART 2 2012 NEW MEXICO PLUMBING CODE

14.8.2.1 ISSUING AGENCY: Construction Industries Division (CID) of the Regulation and Licensing Department.

[14.8.2.1 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.1 NMAC, 05/01/15]

14.8.2.2 SCOPE: This rule applies to all contracting work performed in New Mexico on or after May 1, 2015, that is subject to
the jurisdiction of CID, unless performed pursuant to a permit for which an application was received by CID before that date.
[14.8.2.2 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.2 NMAC, 05/01/15]

14.8.2.3 STATUTORY AUTHORITY: Section 60-13-9 and 60-13-44 NMSA 1978.
[14.8.2.3 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.3 NMAC, 05/01/15]

14.8.2.4 DURATION: Permanent.
[14.8.2.4 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.4 NMAC, 05/01/15]



New Mexico Register / Volume XXVI, Issue 7 / April 16, 2015

319

14.8.2.5 EFFECTIVE DATE:
May 1, 2015, unless a later date is cited at
the end of a section.

[14.8.2.5 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.5 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.6 OBJECTIVE: The
purpose of this rule is to establish minimum
standards for all plumbing, as defined in
Construction Industries Licensing Act
(CILA) Section 60-12-32, in New Mexico.
[14.8.2.6 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.6 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.7 DEFINITIONS: See
14.5.1 NMAC, General Provisions and
Chapter 2 of the 2012 Uniform Plumbing
Code (UPC) as amended in 14.8.2.10
NMAC.

[14.8.2.7 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.7 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.8 ADOPTION OF THE
2012 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE:

A. This rule adopts by
reference the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
and all appendices, as amended by this rule.

B. In this rule, the internal
numbering of each provision corresponds
with the numbering of the 2012 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

C. This rule is to be
applied in conjunction with 14.7.6 NMAC,
the 2009 New Mexico Energy Conservation
Code.

[14.8.2.8 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.8 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.9 CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION:
A. 101.0 General.
1) 101.1

Title. Delete this section of the UPC and
substitute: This code shall be known as
the 2012 New Mexico Plumbing Code
(NMPC).

?) 101.2 Scope.
Delete this section of the UPC and see
14.8.2.2 NMAC.

A3) 101.3
Purpose. Delete this section of the UPC
except as provided in 14.8.2.6 NMAC.

@) 101.4
Conflicts between codes. Delete this
section of the UPC and see 14.5.1 NMAC.

Q)] 101.5 Plans
required. Delete this section of the UPC
except as provided in 14.5.2 NMAC.

(6) 101.7
Maintenance. Delete this section of the
UPC.

(@) 101.8
Existing construction. Delete this section
of the UPC.

®) 101.10
Appendices. Delete this section of the
UPC except in 14.8.2.30 NMAC.

B. 102.0 Organization
and enforcement.

1 102.1
Authority having jurisdiction. Delete this
section of the UPC.

Q) 102.2 Duties
and powers of the authority having
jurisdiction.

(@)
102.2.1 Right of entry. Delete this section
of the UPC and see CILA Section 60-13-42.

(b)
102.2.2 Stop orders. Delete this section of
the UPC and see 14.5.2 NMAC.

©
102.2.3 Authority to disconnect utilities
in emergencies. Delete this section of the
UPC and see CILA Section 60-13-42.

(d
102.2.4 Authority to condemn. Delete
this section of the UPC and see 14.5.1
NMAC.

(O]
102.2.5 Liability. Delete this section of
the UPC and see CILA Section 60-13-26.

A3) 102.3 Board
of appeals. 102.3.1 Limitations of
authority.

@) 102.4
Violations. Delete this section of the UPC
and see CILA Section 60-13-1 to -59, and
14.5.3 NMAC.

5) 102.5
Penalties. Delete this section of the UPC
and see CILA Section 60-13-1 to -59, and
14.5.3 NMAC.

C. 103.0 Permits and
Inspections.

1 103.1
Permits required. Delete this section
of the UPC except as provided in 14.5.2
NMAC.

@) 103.2
Application for permit. Delete this section
of the UPC except as provided in 14.5.2
NMAC.

A3 103.3 Permit
issuance. Delete this section of the UPC
except as provided in 14.5.2 NMAC.

“4) 103.4 Fees.
Delete this section of the UPC and see
14.5.5 NMAC.

5) 103.5
Inspections. Delete this section except as
provided in 14.5.3 NMAC.

6) 103.6
Connection approval. Delete this section
of the UPC and see 14.5.3 NMAC.

@) 103.7
Unconstitutional. Delete this section of
the UPC and see 14.5.1 NMAC.

®) 103.8
Validity. Delete this section of the UPC
and see 14.5.1 NMAC.

) Table 103.4
Plumbing permit fees. Delete plumbing
permit fees, table 103.4, from the UPC.

[14.8.2.9 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.9 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.10 CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS: See this chapter of the
UPC except as provided below.

A. 203.0 Authority
having jurisdiction. Delete the text of
this definition and substitute: The authority
having jurisdiction is the construction
industries division (CID) and the bureau
chief of the mechanical and plumbing
bureau of CID.

B. 214.0 Listing agency.
See this definition in the UPC and Section
60-13-44 of the CILA.

[14.8.2.10 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.10 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.11 CHAPTER 3
GENERAL REGULATIONS: See this
chapter of the UPC except as provided
below.

A. 301.2 Alternate
materials and methods of construction
equivalency. Delete this section of the
UPC and see 14.5.1 NMAC.

B. 301.3 Flood hazard
areas. See this section of the UPC.
C. 301.4 Alternative

engineered design. Sce this section of the
UPC except as provided below.

(0)) 301.4.1
Permit application. Delete this section of
the UPC and see 14.5.2 NMAC.

?2) 301.4.2
Technical data. See this section of the
UPC.

A3 301.4.3
Design documents. See this section of the
UPC and 14.5.2 NMAC.

“@) 301.4.4.
Design approval. Delete this section of the
UPC and see 14.5.2 NMAC.

Q) 301.4.5
Design review. Delete this section of the
UPC and see 14.5.2 NMAC.

(6) 301.4.6
Inspection and testing. Delete this section
of the UPC and see 14.5.2 NMAC and
14.5.3 NMAC.
[14.8.2.11 NMAC - Rp, 14.8.2.11 NMAC,
05/01/15]

14.8.2.12 CHAPTER

4 PLUMBING FIXTURES AND
FIXTURE FITTINGS: See this chapter of
the UPC except as provided below.

A. 402.3.1 Nonwater
urinals. See this section of the UPC and
add the following to the end: Nonwater
urinals shall be located on the downstream
side of a frequently used water-using
fixture.

B. 406.0 Prohibited
fixtures.

(0)) 406.1



